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 County 
 City 
 Town  
 Village of MONTICELLO 
 
 Local Law No.          of the year 2021 
 
A local law to amend the Village Code      
 
Be it enacted by the         BOARD OF TRUSTEES        of the  
 
County 
City 
Town  
Village of   MONTICELLO , as follows: 
 
The purpose of this Local Law is to amend Chapter 252. Vehicles and0 Traffic of the Village of 
Monticello Code, as follows: 
 
§ 252-18. All-night parking. 
 
Amend to read as follows:  
 
“The parking of vehicles is hereby prohibited on all highways within this Village between 10:00 
p.m. and 6:00 a.m. from November 15 of each year to April 1 of the following year.” 

§ 252-19. Parking prohibited at all times in certain locations. 

Add the following: 
 
Name of Street   Side     Location 
 
Nelshore Drive   West    Entire length 
 
§ 252-30. Authority to impound vehicles. 
 
Amend the entire sub-section to read as follows:  
 
A. When any vehicle is parked or abandoned on any highway within this Village during a 
snowstorm, flood, fire or other public emergency which affects that portion of the public 
highway upon which said vehicle is parked or abandoned, said vehicle may be removed by the 



Chief of Police or Highway Superintendent by utilization of the provision of Chapter 236(16) of 
the Village of Monticello Code.  
 
B. When any vehicle is found unattended on any highway within this Village where said vehicle 
constitutes an obstruction to traffic, said vehicle may be removed by the Chief of Police or 
Highway Superintendent by utilization of the provision of Chapter 236(16) of the Village of 
Monticello Code. 
 
C. When any vehicle is parked or abandoned on any highway within this Village where stopping, 
standing or parking is prohibited, said vehicle may be removed by the Chief of Police or 
Highway Superintendent by utilization of the provision of Chapter 236(16) of the Village of 
Monticello Code. 
 
§ 252-33. Delegation of duties. 
 
Amend the entire sub-section to read as follows:  
 
A.  Any of the duties of the Police Chief under this article may be delegated by him to other 
members of the Police Department of the Village. 
 
Add (B.) as follows: 
 
B. Any of the duties of the Highway Superintendent under this article may be delegated by him 
to other members of the Highway Department of the Village. 
 
 
This Local Law shall take effect on ______________ so long as it is filed in the Office of the 
Secretary of State before such date in accordance with section 27 of the Municipal Home Rule 
Law. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
I hereby certify that the local law annexed hereto, designated as local law No.      of 2021 of the 
Village of Monticello was duly passed by the Board of Trustees on __________________ in 
accordance with the applicable provisions of law. 
 
I further certify that I have compared the preceding local law with the original on file in this 
office and that the same is correct transcript therefrom and of the whole of such original local 
law, and was finally adopted in the manner indicated in paragraph 1 above. 
 
 
      _____________________________ 
       Village Clerk 
 
      Date: _______________________ 
 
STATE OF NEW YORK  
COUNTY OF SULLIVAN 
 
I, the undersigned, hereby certify that the foregoing local law contains the correct text and that 
all proper proceedings have been had or taken for the enactment of the local law annexed hereto. 
 
      _____________________________ 
      MICHAEL DAVIDOFF, ESQ. 
 
      SPECIAL COUNSEL TO  
 
      VILLAGE OF MONTICELLO  
 
      Date: ______________________ 


